
Group Size
2-12 Students 
per Course

Course Duration
8 Weeks

• Analysis and 
Application of 
Separations

• Providing Flight 
Information Service 
(FIS)

• Arrival and 
Departure Planning 

• Overflights

• Coordination

• Abnormal and 
Emergency (ABES)/
Degraded Situations 

• Holding and 
Expected Approach 
Times (EATs)

Course Curriculum
This standalone course is available to those who have 
completed the UK Basic Training Course and looking to 
work in an Approach Procedural environment (non-radar). 
The course is also ideal for Air Traffic Controller license 
holders seeking to obtain an additional rating.

Candidates wishing to undertake the Approach procedural 
Course must be able to demonstrate that they meet the 
following entry criteria:

• Successful Completion of the UK Basic Training Course 
(BTC)

• Hold a Valid European Class 3 Medical 

• An excellent command of oral and written English, 
assessed to ICAO Level 4 English Language Proficiency 
at minimum

Who Is This Course For?

Following successful completion, Global ATS’ APP course 
awards candidates with the Approach Control Procedural 
(APP) rating. 

The course is split into two key modules; controlled and 
uncontrolled environments. Within these models the 
course supplies candidates with comprehensive 
theoretical and practical training on a variety of complex 
control procedural techniques. 

Practical exercises, in particular, cover various traffic 
types through exercises of increasing complexity and 
traffic density.

A combined Tower and Approach operations module is 
also available following completion of the course.

Course Summary

APPROACH PROCEDURAL 
(APP)

For more information regarding Global ATS’ Approach 
Procedural Course, or any of our UK CAA-Approved courses, 
please contact us via the link below: 

info@global-ats.com
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